
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 18-18138
 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Medium Duty Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 2, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

19 ea.   *      

11,000 GVWR (minimum) two-wheel drive, extended cab truck with installed UNIT PRICE 57,600.00 NO BID 47,488.58 51,032.00 51,871.00 49,927.00 53,135.00 54,700.00

service body, per specifications TOTAL 1,094,400.00  902,283.02 969,608.00 985,549.00 948,613.00 1,009,565.00 1,039,300.00

A. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL Ram 3500  2019 Ford F350 Ford F350 Ford F350 Ford F350  Chev. CC30943

2 ea..   *      

11,000 GVWR (minimum) single rear wheel, 4x2 regular cab truck with installed UNIT PRICE 56,600.00 NO BID 48,772.74 51,524.00 51,904.00 51,085.00 53,505.00 56,823.00

service body & 1,600 lbs. cap. Lift gate TOTAL 113,200.00  97,545.48 103,048.00 103,808.00 102,170.00 107,010.00 113,646.00

B. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL Ram 3500  2019 Ford F350 Ford F350 RC Ford F350 Ford F350  Chev. CC30943

6 ea. *

19,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 regular-cab, cab-chassis with installed reinforced UNIT PRICE 102,455.00 101,894.00 89,927.69 97,172.00 94,219.00 93,341.00 95,524.00 98,842.00

utility body and  a 6,000 lb. corner mounted crane TOTAL 614,730.00 611,364.00 539,566.14 583,032.00 565,314.00 560,046.00 573,144.00 593,052.00

C. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL Ram 5500 Int'l. CV515 2019 Ford F550 Ford F550 RC Ford F550 Ford F550  Chev. CC56403

1 ea.  *

19,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 regular-cab, cab-chassis with installed 18' platform UNIT PRICE 58,779.00 54,565.00 52,653.39 55,640.00 58,206.00 56,503.00 57,446.00 57,150.00

body with stake pockets TOTAL 58,779.00 54,565.00 52,653.39 55,640.00 58,206.00 56,503.00 57,446.00 57,150.00

D. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL Ram 5500 Int'l. CV515 2019 Ford F550 Ford F550 RC Ford F550 Ford F550  Chev. CC56403

7 ea. *

25,000 GVWR cab-chassis, 4-door, crew-cab, 84" CA truck with installed UNIT PRICE NO BID 137,342.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID 135,767.00 NO BID NO BID 

aluminum utility body and 2,000 lb. crane TOTAL  961,399.74    950,369.00   

E. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL  Chev 2500HD    Ford F750   

1 ea.   *

25,000 GVWR cab-chassis, 2-door, regular-cab, truck with installed 22' UNIT PRICE NO BID 78,340.82 NO BID NO BID 71,823.00 78,803.00 74,189.00 DOES NOT

platform bed with stake pockets TOTAL  78,340.82   71,823.00 78,803.00 74,189.00 MEET

F. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL  Int'l. MV607   Ford F650 Ford F750 Ford F650 SPECIFICATIONS

1 ea.  *

14,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 regular-cab, cab-chassis with installed 10' UNIT PRICE NO BID 53,199.00 48,991.07 55,204.00 49,322.00 50,038.00 50,670.00 54,750.00

platform body with stake pockets and 2,000 lbp powered lift-gate TOTAL  53,199.00 48,991.07 55,204.00 49,322.00 50,038.00 50,670.00 54,750.00

G. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL  Int'l CV515 2019 Ford F350 Ford F450 RC Ford F350 Ford F350 Ford F3G Chev. CC56403

Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

350 days

200 days 150-180 days 120 days  

Delivery Days 180-200 days 365 days 98 days 150-180 days 120 days 180-240 days 180-220 days 300 days

*LOW BIDDER

**ITEM F AWARDED INFORMALLY ($50,000 - $100,000)

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Alamo City Chev Kenworth French Ellison

Ancira Chrysler Jeep Kyrish Truck Centers Demandstar

Ancira Motor Co. Lone Star Chrysler SAWS Website

Bluebonnet Chrysl Dodge North Park Toyota

Bluebonnet Ford Red McCombs Ford

Caldwell Country Chev Red McCombs Toyota Ford

Freightliner of SA Sam Packs Five Star Ford

Grande Truck Center Silsbee Ford

Jordan Ford Toyota of Boerne
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